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St Mary's Balcombe

Sunn

From the Rector

On 4m' March we have our annual Pancake Café. As our newly updated church
website reminds us, “It is one last chance for a big party before Lent begins with Ash
Wednesday the next day.” Do come along and join in the pancake fun and enjoy
some of your favourite toppings!! Do also take a moment to check out the website
and let us know what you think —www.stmarys-balcombe.org It has details of all that

is going on during Lent and Easter as well as information about our regular activities
and services.

The day after Pancake Day or Shrove Tuesday is Ash Wednesday, the beginning of
Lent, the forty days leading up to Easter (if you take out Sundays) reminding us of the
forty days that Jesus spent in the wilderness before starting his public ministry. To
reflect this and to prepare for Easter, traditionally people use this period of time to
give something up or abstain from a meal or a particular treat or habit.

Somebody once asked a Christian friend why he was eating doughnuts, when he had
given them up for Lent! He answered, ‘I told God, that if He wanted me to buy
doughnuts, He should provide a parking space in front of the bakers. On the eighth
time driving around, there it was!’ Rather than seeing Lent simply as a time to give
things up, this year let's use it intentionally for self-examination, reading Scripture,
penitence, fasting and prayer.

At Jesus’ baptism, God’s voice says, ‘You are My Son, whom | love; with You | am
well pleased.’ (Luke 3:22). The Holy Spirit then leads Jesus into the wilderness,
where we find Him coming to terms with who He is. Satan’s temptations challenge
Jesus in key three areas of His identity: His divine sonship, political power and
Messianic role (Luke 4: 1-13). It is as though Jesus was looking into the mirror at
Himself to discern what kind of Saviour He should be.

For us, Lent is an opportunity to hold up a mirror to ourselves and ask the question,
“Who am 17’ It's a season of honest encounter with who we are, what we've done,
and how we should live. What will we see when we hold up the mirror to ourselves?
Keeping Lent, the 40 days running up to Easter, could mean taking time to read
Scripture, studying a Christian book or spending five minutes each day in silence! We
might fast by missing one or two meals, refraining from TV, alcohol, social media or
scrolling on our phones. All of these can help us to give more attention to God in our
lives.

Whatever we do, Lent is a season for self-reflection, as we put ourselves in a position
to receive afresh the forgiveness and healing that God offers.

With many blessings

Fr David




